<@ Fw: Gothrough the attached doc for proposed method for tax deduction
from incentiove voucher (CCF No. CQ14/CS6011 - A14CSUNO0O01)
- Nilesh Parikh to: Piyush Parikh 12/03/15 08:36 AM

Follow Up: Normal Priority.

Dear Piyushbhai,

Please do the needful

Nilesh Parikh
Information Technology

Acme Plaza, Andheri-Kurla Road,
Andheri (East)

Mumbai, Maharashtra (India) — 400 059
Office  # +91 22 42244347

Email # nilesh.parikh@sunpharma.com
www.sunpharma.com

From: Milind Goradia/MKTG SERVICES/CHAKALA/SPIL

To: Nilesh Parikh/INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY/ANDHERI/SPIL@SPIL

Date: 11-03-2015 03:32 PM

Subject: Gothrough the attached doc for proposed method for tax deduction from incentiove voucher

(CCF No. CQ14/CS6011 - A14CSUNO001)

| have not received any feedback , you may go ahead with what you are proposing

Incentive working however should be parameterized i.e. we should be able to decide when to deduct
& when not to deduct

eg | may decide not to deduct TDS in Q1 incentive payout but may want to deduct in Q3 Incentive
payout, system should allow flexibility

With-in this , we do not want any further parameterization , i.e. we do not require system to deduct for
some divisions and not for others etc

Regards,
Milind
Milind Goradia Dear Milindbhai, 06-03-2015 23:55:20
From: Milind Goradia/MKTG SERVICES/CHAKALA/SPIL
To: Nilesh Parikh/INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY/ANDHERI/SPIL@spil
Date: 06-03-2015 23:55
Subject: Fw: Re. Gothrough the attached doc for proposed method for tax deduction from incentiove

voucher (CCF No. CQ14/CS6011 - A14CSUNO001)

| have asked Jagdishbhai to give his feedback

Sent from IBM Notes Traveler

Nilesh Parikh --- Fw: Re. Gothrough the attached doc for proposed method for tax deduction



from incentiove voucher (CCF No. CQ14/CS6011 - A14CSUNOO1) ---

From: "Nilesh Parikh" <Nilesh.Parikh@sunpharma.com>

To: "Milind Goradia" <Milind.Goradia@sunpharma.com>

Cc:  "Piyush Parikh" <Piyush.Parikh@sunpharma.com>

Date: Fri, Mar 6, 2015 11:25 PM

Subje Fw: Re. Gothrough the attached doc for proposed method for tax deduction from incentiove voucher (CCF No.
ct:  CQ14/CS6011 - A14CSUNO001L)

Dear Milindbhai,

Request you give your feedback.

Nilesh Parikh
Information Technology

Acme Plaza, Andheri-Kurla Road,
Andheri (East)

Mumbai, Maharashtra (India) — 400 059
Office # +91 22 42244347

Email # nilesh.parikh@sunpharma.com

www.sunpharma.com

----- Forwarded by Nilesh Parikh/INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY/ANDHERI/SPIL on 06-03-2015 11:24 PM

From: Piyush Parikn/INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY/ANDHERI/SPIL

To: Nilesh Parikh/INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY/ANDHERI/SPIL@SPIL

Date: 05-03-2015 09:20 PM

Subject: Fw: Re. Gothrough the attached doc for proposed method for tax deduction from incentiove voucher

(CCF No. CQ14/CS6011 - A14CSUNO001)

Dear Nileshbhai,
Any feedback?

Regards
Piyush J. Parekh

----- Forwarded by Piyush Parikh/INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY/ANDHERI/SPIL on 05/03/15 09:24 PM

From: Piyush Parikn/INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY/ANDHERI/SPIL

To: Nilesh Parikh/INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY/ANDHERI/SPIL@SPIL

Date: 02/03/15 03:03 PM

Subject: Re. Gothrough the attached doc for proposed method for tax deduction from incentiove voucher (CCF

No. CQ14/CS6011 - A14CSUNOOL)

Dear Nileshbhai,



Please find attached document for proposed method for deducting tax from incentive
voucher.
Request you to go through the attached document and provide your suggestion on the same.

Regards
Piyush J. Parekh

@j

(See attached file: PROPOSED-TAX-LOGIC.docx) PROPOSED-TAX-LOGIC.docx



